REQ.24/25
REQUISITION FORM FY 24/25

DATE PREPARED: _ 3/31/2025

REQ. CONTACT PERSON:_ Jonathan Dotzler
REASON: Replacement for RD094 and RD1037
VENDOR # OR NAME: Bartow Ford

CONTACT & TEL:___ Richard Weissinger (813) 477-0052
EMAIL ADDRESS:  thefordtruckqguy@gmail.com
VENDOR ADDRESS:

SHIP TO: PW-WC-LA-FT _ (CIRCLE ONE)

DELIVER BY DATE:

ITEM DESCRIPTION:

LINE #1: Qty 2 Ford F-350 4x4 regular cab

Pasco County Bid No. IFB-RR-21.042

QTY.: 2
ORDER UOM:
UNIT COST: $62,213.57 TOTAL REQ. AMT. $126,427.14

ACCOUNT# _ 508.04.0460.513.64.00

)/ % 3/31/25
APPROVED:

ASST. PW DIRECTOR DATE
CAPITAL OUTLAY #
APPROVED:
DIRECTOR DATE
FISCAL ASST:
DATE

COMMENTS: New POR based on PO 2023-1422 for Road & Bride F550 replacements.

Operational needs changed to F350's instead of F550's and are also

cheaper repalcements.




sARTOWFORD

March 27, 2025 INTEGRITY-TRUST-HONESTY
Since 1948

Alachua County
Jonathan Dotzler

DESCRIPTION
F3F 12024 F-350 Chassis 4x4 SD Regualr Cab 145" WB SRW XL
99N |7.3L Gas V8 Engine
44G | TorgShift 10-Speed Automatic Transmission
X4M|4.30 Electronic Locking Rear Axle
43K |Pro Power On Board
90L [Power Equipment Group
76C|Back Up Alarm
86M|Dual Battery
18B [Platform Running Boards
872 |Rear View Camera & Prep Kit

Factory Invoice $53,116.00
Government Price Concession Discount $600.00
4.06% Contract Discount $2,132.15

Steel Skirted 9' Goooseneck Body with Underbody Tool Boxes, Class V Hitch with 7 Way Round
Plug, Whelen 55" DUO Legacy Amber/White Lightbar STUD Mounted to Headboard, Pro Power
Mounted in Curb Side Front Tool Box, (2) Whelen Amber/White Vertex Flange Mounted in Grill
Area (2), (2) Whelen Amber/White Vertex Flange Mounted in Rear

UPFITTER SWITCHES:

1. ALL POWER TO LIGHTBAR & 4 CORNERS

2. SCENE FRONT & 2 REAR WHITE WORK LIGHTS

3. LEFT ARROW REAR

4. RIGHT ARROW REAR

5. LEFT ALLEY

6. RIGHT ALLEY

$11,665.72

12 [Bartow Ford Labor Hours | $97.00 $1,164.00

TOTAL PURCHASE AMOUNT PER UNIT $63,213.57

TOTAL PURCHASE AMOUNT FOR TWO UNITS $126,427.14
Pricing in accordance with the Pasco County Award of Bid No. IFB-RR-21-042

If you have any questions or need any additional information please feel free contact me anytime.

Sincerely Yours,

Richard Weissinger
Commercial Fleet Sales
Direct Line (813) 477-0052

2800 US Hwy North
Bartow, Florida 33830



Kristina Muzzey

From: Jonathan Dotzler

Sent: Monday, March 3, 2025 3:20 PM

To: Kristina Muzzey

Cc: Kenneth Fair; Alex Corona; Donald Clifton

Subject: FW: Skirted gooseneck

Attachments: 22525 2024 F350 GOOSENECK BODY WORKSHEET xls
Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Due By: Tuesday, March 4, 2025 8:00 AM

Flag Status: Flagged

Kristina,

Per my conversation with OMB last week, PO 2023-1422 has been approved to proceed with the
adjustment of the attached quote. Originally, this PO was for two 2023 F550’s at $165,750.89.

Since the needs of the department have changed and the Vendor was unable to retain the vehicles, they
are requesting two F350’s at $126,427.14.

Please let me know if you have any questions. Thank you!

Jonathan P. Dotzler

From: Richard Weissinger <thefordtruckguy@gmail.com>
Sent: Monday, March 3, 2025 3:07 PM

To: Jonathan Dotzler <jdotzler@alachuacounty.us>
Subject: Re: Skirted gooseneck

John,

Here the quote for the two F350's.

Sincerely Yours,

Richard Weissinger
Commercial Fleet Sales
Bartow Ford

2800 US Hwy. 98 North
Bartow,FL. 33830
Bartow Ford EVT

698 Cessna Street
Bartow, FL. 33830



Office (800)-533-0425

Cell (813)-477-0052

E-mail : thefordtruckguy@gmail.com
WWW.BARTOWFORD.COM

NOTICE: This email transmission contains privileged and confidential information intended only for the
use of the individual or entity named above. Any unauthorized review, use, disclosure or distribution is
prohibited and may be a violation of law. If you are not the intended recipient or a person responsible for
delivering this message to an intended recipient, please delete the email and immediately notify the
sender via the email return address.

On Mon, Mar 3, 2025 at 2:57 PM Jonathan Dotzler <jdotzler@alachuacounty.us> wrote:

Can you requote this and include 2 F350’s with the flat bed we discussed? | will get the PO 2023-1422
adjusted and sent to you!

Jonathan P. Dotzler

From: Richard Weissinger <thefordtruckguy@gmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, February 25, 2025 1:49 PM

To: Jonathan Dotzler <jdotzler@alachuacounty.us>
Subject: Re: Skirted gooseneck

John,

Here's the information for the 20224 F350's



Sincerely Yours,

Richard Weissinger
Commercial Fleet Sales
Bartow Ford

2800 US Hwy. 98 North
Bartow,FL. 33830

Bartow Ford EVT
698 Cessna Street
Bartow, FL. 33830

Office (800)-533-0425

Cell (813)-477-0052

E-mail : thefordtruckguy@gmail.com
WWW.BARTOWFORD.COM

NOTICE: This email transmission contains privileged and confidential information intended only for the
use of the individual or entity named above. Any unauthorized review, use, disclosure or distribution is
prohibited and may be a violation of law. If you are not the intended recipient or a person responsible for
delivering this message to an intended recipient, please delete the email and immediately notify the
sender via the email return address.

On Tue, Feb 25, 2025 at 11:23 AM Jonathan Dotzler <jdotzler@alachuacounty.us> wrote:

Richard —don’t forget my quote for the 2024 F350 4WD Single Cab X2 for PO2023-1422. Thanks!

Jonathan P. Dotzler

Jonathan Dotzler

Fleet Manager

Public Works

5620 NW 120th Lane « Gainesville * FL « 32653

352-548-1259 (office) « 3522134828 (mobile) « 3864180331 (fax)



anan ALACHUA
200 counTy
1824-2024 | BiIcCENTENNIAL

PLEASE NOTE: Florida has a very broad public records law (F.S.119).
All e-mails to and from County Officials and County Staff are kept as public records. Your e-mail
communications, including your e-mail address, may be disclosed to the public and media at any time.

From: Richard Weissinger <thefordtruckguy@gmail.com>
Sent: Monday, February 24, 2025 4:50 PM

To: Jonathan Dotzler <jdotzler@alachuacounty.us>
Subject: Fwd: Skirted gooseneck

CAUTION: This email originated from outside your organization. Exercise caution when opening
attachments or clicking links, especially from unknown senders.

Sincerely Yours,

Richard Weissinger
Commercial Fleet Sales
Bartow Ford

2800 US Hwy. 98 North
Bartow,FL. 33830

Bartow Ford EVT
698 Cessna Street
Bartow, FL. 33830

Office (800)-533-0425

Cell (813)-477-0052

E-mail : thefordtruckquy@gmail.com
WWW.BARTOWFORD.COM




NOTICE: This email transmission contains privileged and confidential information intended only for the
use of the individual or entity named above. Any unauthorized review, use, disclosure or distribution is
prohibited and may be a violation of law. If you are not the intended recipient or a person responsible
for delivering this message to an intended recipient, please delete the email and immediately notify the
sender via the email return address.
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