stryker

Alachua Powerloads

Quote Number: 11051753

Version: 1

Prepared For: ALACHUA COUNTY FIRE RESCUE

Attn:
Quote Date: 02/24/2025
Expiration Date: 05/25/2025

Delivery Address Sold To - Shipping

Name: ALACHUA COUNTY FIRE Name:
RESCUE SVCS

Account #: 20033137 Account #:

Address: 5900 NW 13TH ST Address:
GAINESVILLE
Florida 32653

Equipment Products:

# Product Description

1.0 639005550001 MTS POWER LOAD

Price Totals:

Prices: In effect for 30 days

Terms: Net 30 Days

Remit to:

Rep:
Email:

Phone Number:

ALACHUA COUNTY FIRE
RESCUE

20032639

911 SE5TH ST
GAINESVILLE
Florida 32601-8011

1

Stryker Sales, LLC

21343 NETWORK PLACE
CHICAGO IL 60673-1213
USA

Meredith Roberts
meredith.roberts@stryker.com

(407) 2226006

Bill To Account

Name: ALACHUA COUNTY FIRE
RESCUE
Account #: 20032639
Address: 911 SE5TH ST
GAINESVILLE
Florida 32601-8011
Qty Sell Price Total
2 $31,290.16 $62,580.32
Equipment Total: $62,580.32
Estimated Sales Tax (0.000%): $0.00
Freight/Shipping: $782.26
Grand Total: $63,362.58

Stryker Medical - Accounts Receivable - accountsreceivable@stryker.com - PO BOX 93308 - Chicago, IL 60673-3308




stryker

Alachua Powerloads

Quote Number: 11051753 Remit to: Stryker Sales, LLC
21343 NETWORK PLACE
CHICAGO IL 60673-1213
USA
Version: 1
Prepared For: ALACHUA COUNTY FIRE RESCUE Rep: Meredith Roberts
Attn: Email: meredith.roberts@stryker.com

Phone Number: (407) 2226006

Quote Date: 02/24/2025
Expiration Date: 05/25/2025

Terms and Conditions:

Deal Consummation: This is a quote and not a commitment. This quote is subject to final credit, pricing, and documentation
approval. Legal documentation must be signed before your equipment can be delivered. Documentation will be provided upon
completion of our review process and your selection of a payment schedule. Confidentiality Notice: Recipient will not disclose to
any third party the terms of this quote or any other information, including any pricing or discounts, offered to be provided by
Stryker to Recipient in connection with this quote, without Stryker’s prior written approval, except as may be requested by law
or by lawful order of any applicable government agency. A copy of Stryker Medical's terms and conditions can be found at_https://
techweb.stryker.com/Terms_Conditions/index.html.
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From: Jacqueline A. Taylor

To: Mandy Mullins

Subject: FW: Stryker Quote # 11051753
Date: Monday, March 10, 2025 4:50:13 PM
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Good afternoon,
Please let me know if the below response from the vendor will suffice?

Thank you,
Jackie Taylor

From: Roberts, Meredith <meredith.roberts@stryker.com>
Sent: Monday, March 10, 2025 4:30 PM

To: Jacqueline A. Taylor <jataylor@alachuacounty.us>
Subject: Re: Stryker Quote # 11051753

CAUTION: This email originated from outside your organization. Exercise caution when opening attachments or clicking links,
especially from unknown senders.

Hi Jackie,
No, there won't be any other signatures needed for this one. We will use the purchase order to place the order.
Let me know if anything else comes up!

Thank you!
Get Qutlook for j0S

From: Jacqueline A. Taylor <jataylor@alachuacounty.us>
Sent: Monday, March 10, 2025 4:25 PM

To: Roberts, Meredith <meredith.roberts@stryker.com>
Subject: Stryker Quote # 11051753

EXTERNAL EMAIL
Good afternoon Meredith,

Procurement was reviewing our purchase order request for the attached quote. At the bottom of the quote it states that legal
documentation must be signed before the equipment can be delivered. Will the Purchase Order suffice or will there need to be
additional documentation signed?
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Terms and Conditions:
Deal Consummation: This is a redit, pricing, and documentation
approval. Legal documentation umentation will be provided upon
‘completion of ou review process and your selection of a payment schedule. Confidentiality Notice: Recipient will not disclose to
any third party the terms of this quote or any other information, including any pricing or discounts, offered to be provided by
Stryker to Recipient in connection with this quote, without Stryker's prior written approval, except as may be requested by law
or by lawful order of any applicable govermment agency. A copy of Stryker Medical's terms and conditions can be found at hitps:/
techwebsiryker.com/Terms_Conditons/index il
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Terms and Conditions:

Deal Consummation: This is a quote and not a commitment. This quote is subject to final credit, pricing, and documentation
approval. Legal documentation must be signed before your equipment can be delivered. Documentation will be provided upon
completion of our review process and your selection of a payment schedule. Confidentiality Notice: Recipient will not disclose to
any third party the terms of this quote or any other information, including any pricing or discounts, offered to be provided by
Stryker to Recipient in connection with this quote, without Stryker's prior written approval, except as may be requested by law
or by lawful order of any applicable government agency. A copy of Stryker Medical's terms and conditions can be found at hitps.//

Thank you,
Jackie Taylor

Jacqueline A. Taylor

Senior Fiscal Assistant

Fire Rescue

911 SE 5th St « Gainesville « FL « 32601
352-384-3101 (office)

nnn ALACHUA
COUNTY

1824-2024 | BICENTENNIAL

GONOBDOS

PLEASE NOTE: Florida has a very broad public records law (F.S.119).
All e-mails to and from County Officials and County Staff are kept as public records. Your e-mail
communications, including your e-mail address, may be disclosed to the public and media at any time.

CAUTION: External email. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is
safe. Please forward all suspicious emails to information ri ryker.

Follow this link to read our Privacy Statement
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