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EVALUATION TABULATION 
ITB No. ITB 25-118-MM 

Annual Purchase of Antifreeze, Oils and Lubricants 

RESPONSE DEADLINE: May 29, 2024 at 2:00 pm 

 

 
Wednesday, July 17, 2024 
 
CATEGORY 1: MOTOR OIL   
Primary award cells are green and Backup award cells are gray 

 Almond Oil 
Company 

Lewis Oil 
Comapny 

Inc. 

Palmdale 
Oil 

Company 
LLC 

SAFETY-
KLEEN 

SYSTEMS, 
INC. 

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of 
Measure 

Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost 

1 NAPA SAE 10W-30 Motor Oil 1 Quart $4.79 No Bid $3.3438 No Bid 

5 NAPA 0W-40 Oil 1 Quart No Bid No Bid $3.88 No Bid 

9 NAPA SAE 0W-20 Motor Oil Full Synthetic 1 Quart $6.99 No Bid $4.00 $3.08 

13 NAPA SAE 5W-20 Motor Oil Synthetic Blend 1 Quart $3.79 No Bid $2.90 $3.08 

17 NAPA SAE 5W-30 Motor Oil Synthetic Blend 1 Quart $3.79 No Bid $2.90 No Bid 

21 Mobil SAE 0W-40 Motor Oil Full Synthetic 
European Formula 

1 Quart No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

28 Pennzoil SAE 0W-40 Motor Oil Full 
Synthetic 

1 Drum No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

32 Safeguard SAE 5W-20 Motor Oil Synthetic 
Blend 

1 Drum $599.00 No Bid $384.00 $554.93 

36 Superguard SAE 5W-30 Motor Oil Full 
Synthetic 

1 Drum $599.00 No Bid $541.34 $665.59 

39 Rando HD 22 Motor Oil 1 Bucket No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

48 Delo 400 SDE SAE 15W-40 Diesel Engine Oil 1 Drum $649.00 $1,017.03 $740.00 $643.59 

49 Delo 400 SDE SAE 15W-40 Diesel Engine Oil 1 Bulk $11.99 $19.89 $10.74 $12.01 
 

CATEGORY 2: TRANSMISSION FLUID   
Primary award cells are green and Backup award cells are gray 
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 Almond Oil 
Company 

Lewis Oil 
Comapny 

Inc. 

Palmdale 
Oil 

Company 
LLC 

SAFETY-
KLEEN 

SYSTEMS, 
INC. 

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of 
Measure 

Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost 

50 NAPA Dexron VI ATF Automatic 
Transmission Fluid 

1 Quart $7.40 No Bid No Bid $3.17 

55 Castrol TranSynd 668 Full Sythetic 
Transmission Fluid 

1 Gallon $32.70 No Bid $33.27 No Bid 

60 Delo Syn-Trans HD SAE 50 Transmission 
Fluid 

1 Bucket $159.99 $183.53 $91.64 No Bid 

 

CATEGORY 3: GREASE   
Primary award cells are green and Backup award cells are gray 

 Almond Oil 
Company 

Lewis Oil 
Comapny 

Inc. 

Palmdale 
Oil 

Company 
LLC 

SAFETY-
KLEEN 

SYSTEMS, 
INC. 

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of 
Measure 

Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost 

66 Delo Grease ESI HD EP2 1 Quart No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

66 Delo Grease ESI HD EP2 Quart/Tube/Case 
(10) 

1 Case $48.00 $182.12 No Bid $45.39 

 

CATEGORY 4: HYDRAULIC FLUID   
Primary award cells are green and Backup award cells are gray 

 Almond Oil 
Company 

Lewis Oil 
Comapny 

Inc. 

Palmdale 
Oil 

Company 
LLC 

SAFETY-
KLEEN 

SYSTEMS, 
INC. 

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of 
Measure 

Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost 

83 HyDurance AW CP Fluid Hydraulic Oil 1 Drum $849.00 No Bid $1,012.23 No Bid 

87 Hydurance AW Fluid 68 Hydraulic Oil 1 Drum $499.00 No Bid $607.00 $538.75 

91 Transguard Tractor Hydraulic Fluid 1 Drum $599.00 No Bid $766.90 No Bid 

95 JohnDeere Hydraulic Oil 46 Zinc-Free ISO 46 1 Drum $129.00 No Bid No Bid $497.99 

98 CAT HYDO Advanced 10 Hydraulic Oil SAE 
10W 

1 Bucket $99.00 No Bid $87.98 No Bid 

103 Chevron AW68-HYD Hydraulic Fluid 1 Drum $499.00 $581.01 $607.00 No Bid 
 

CATEGORY 5: COOLANT/ANTIFREEZE   
Primary award cells are green and Backup award cells are gray 
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 Almond Oil 
Company 

Lewis Oil 
Comapny 

Inc. 

Palmdale 
Oil 

Company 
LLC 

SAFETY-
KLEEN 

SYSTEMS, 
INC. 

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of 
Measure 

Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost 

107 Fleetcool EX 50/50 Prediluted Heavyduty 
Antifreeze/Coolant 

1 Drum No Bid No Bid $351.06 $375.19 

111 Fleetcool ES Compleat OAT 50/50 
Prediluted Extended Life 

Antifreeze/Coolant 

1 Drum No Bid No Bid $509.67 $330.17 

113 Motorcraft Gold Concentrated 
Antifreeze/Coolant Concentrated 

1 Gallon No Bid No Bid $487.19 No Bid 

 

CATEGORY 6: LUBRICANT AND OTHER PRODUCTS   
Primary award cells are green and Backup award cells are gray 

 Almond Oil 
Company 

Lewis Oil 
Comapny 

Inc. 

Palmdale 
Oil 

Company 
LLC 

SAFETY-
KLEEN 

SYSTEMS, 
INC. 

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of 
Measure 

Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost 

116 Motorcraft SAE 75W-140 Synthetic Rear 
Axle Lubricant 

1 Quart No Bid No Bid $6.70 No Bid 

120 NAPA 9832 Power Steering Fluid 1 Quart No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

124 Valvoline SAE 75W-90 Full Synthetic Gear 
Oil 

1 Quart No Bid No Bid $4.82 No Bid 

128 Valvoline SAE 80W-90 Gear Oil 1 Quart No Bid No Bid $3.89 No Bid 
 

CATEGORY 10: BLANKET PERCENT OFF   
Primary award cells are green and Backup award cells are gray 

 Almond Oil 
Company 

Lewis Oil 
Comapny Inc. 

Palmdale Oil 
Company LLC 

SAFETY-KLEEN 
SYSTEMS, INC. 

Line Item Description Unit of Measure Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost 

132 Blanket Percentage Off MSRP 
of All Products Provided by 
Vendor and Not Seperately 

Listed Above 

% $5.00 $1,983.58 $0.00 $0.00 

 

VENDOR QUESTIONNAIRE PASS/FAIL 

Question Title Almond Oil Company Lewis Oil Comapny 
Inc. 

Palmdale Oil 
Company LLC 

SAFETY-KLEEN 
SYSTEMS, INC. 

Submittal 
Confirmation 

Pass Pass Pass Pass 

Corporate Resolution Pass Pass Pass Pass 
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Question Title Almond Oil Company Lewis Oil Comapny 
Inc. 

Palmdale Oil 
Company LLC 

SAFETY-KLEEN 
SYSTEMS, INC. 

State Compliance Pass Pass Pass Pass 

Public Record Trade 
Secret or Proprietary 
Confidential Business 

Information 
Exemption Request 

Pass Pass Pass Pass 

Public Record Trade 
Secret or Proprietary 
Confidential Business 

Information 
Exemption Request 

Pass Pass Pass Pass 

Public Record Trade 
Secret or Proprietary 
Confidential Business 

Information 
Exemption Request 

No Response No Response No Response No Response 

Option 1: Company is 
an Alachua County 

Certified Small 
Business Enterprise. 

Pass Pass Pass Pass 

SBE Certificate No Response No Response No Response No Response 

Option 2: I certify 
that our Company 
will perform ALL 
work and that no 

subcontractors will 
be utilized for this 

bid. 

Pass Pass Pass Pass 

Option 3: SBE 
Participation. 

Pass Pass Pass Pass 

Option 4: SBE Good 
Faith Effort. 

Pass Pass Pass Pass 

Alachua County 
Government 

Minimum Wage 
(GMW) 

Pass Pass Pass Pass 

DRUG FREE 
WORKPLACE 

Pass Pass Pass Pass 

Vendor Eligibility Pass Pass Pass Pass 

Responsible Agent Pass Pass Pass Pass 

Number of years in 
this type of service? 

Pass Pass Pass Pass 
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Question Title Almond Oil Company Lewis Oil Comapny 
Inc. 

Palmdale Oil 
Company LLC 

SAFETY-KLEEN 
SYSTEMS, INC. 

Number of years 
licensed in Alachua 

County? 

Pass Pass Pass Pass 

How many 
employees "ON THE 

JOB" each week? 

Pass Pass Pass Pass 

Number of 
employees "ON 

CALL" each week? 

Pass Pass Pass Pass 

Major Equipment Pass Pass Pass Pass 

Do you currently hold 
any municipality 

contracts? 

Pass Pass Pass Pass 

If you indicated yes 
to holding 

municipality 
contracts please list 

them below: 

Pass Pass Pass Fail 

References Pass Fail Pass Pass 

Are your employees 
screened by: 

Pass Pass Pass Pass 

Cancelled or 
Termination 

Pass Pass Pass Pass 

Cancellation and 
Termination 

No Response Pass Pass Pass 

What constitutes 
your normal business 

days and working 
hours? 

Pass Pass Pass Pass 

Describe below, the 
Bidder’s operational 

plan for providing the 
Services to Alachua 

County. 

Pass Fail Pass Pass 

Conflict of Interest Pass Pass Pass Pass 

Product Data Sheets Pass No Response  Pass 

Acknowledgement of 
Requirements 

 Pass  Pass 

 




